
Lake Oswego City League
Women tennis players wanted for City League teams at Lake 

Oswego tennis facility. Sign up now. Forms available at tennis center.

•All skill levels   •All ages, 19 and over   •Resident and non-resident  

WANTED: WOMEN TENNIS PLAYERS
LAKE OSWEGO CITY LEAGUE

LAKE OSWEGO TENNIS CENTER, 2900 S.W. DIANE DR., LAKE OSWEGO                     CALL: 503-635-5550

The Season
•Begins in September and ends in 
May with a total of 16 matches, 
half at home and half away.

The Cost
•Fees include court time for home 
matches and one team practice 
per week. Lessons may be 
included. •Average cost is $250  
each term, fall and spring. •All 
play is indoors.

The Teams
•Teams are divided into skill 
levels from A - K. •Wednesday is 
match day for levels A-F. 

•Tuesday is match day for levels 
G-K. •Matches start around noon 
and end about  3 p.m. •Each match 
has two rounds of 3 matches—5 
doubles matches and one singles 
match.

The Players
•Teams have an average of 15 
players. •Players are expected to 
be available for 50 percent of the 
matches and practices. •Teams are 
formed in June; season starts in 
September. •Players on the 
waiting list  will be considered for 
t e am p l acemen t ba sed on 
availability and skill. •Players 
may be added mid-season.

All about City League Tennis

     City League is an organization 
of 20 different tennis facilities 
from around the greater Portland 
area with more than 1,750 players.
     The tennis league provides an 
opportunity for women to enjoy 
competitive tennis, share lunch; 
meet other players and have some 
sporting fun.
     Lake Oswego has a total of 
eight City League teams. 
Currently, the teams range from 
the advanced B division to the J 
division for newer players. 
Alphabetical designations simply 
show variations in skill levels, 
roughly corresponding to 
beginner, intermediate and 
advanced.


